IN THE COURT OF APPEALS OF THE STATE OF MISSISSIPPI

ROGER A. CARROLL

DEFENDANT / APPELLANT

V.

NO. 2010-CA-00823-COA

ANNA F. CARROLL

PLAINTIFF/APPELLEE

ON APPEAL FROM JUDGMENT ON REMAND TO THE CHANCERY COURT OF MONROE COUNTY MISSISSIPPI

SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF OF APPELLEE ANNA F. CARROLL

CARTER DOBBS, JR.

MISSISSIPPI BAR NO 103 2ND AVENUE NORTH POST OFFICE BOX 517 AMORY, MISSISSIPPI 38821

TEL: (662) 256-5697 FAX: (662) 256-1483

ATTORNEY FOR THE APPELLEE
ORAL ARGUMENT NOT REQUESTED

APPELLEE ANNA F. CARROLL'S SUPPLEMENTAL BRIEF

Pursuant to the Order of the Court in the above styled and numbered cause entered on October 3, 2011, Appellee Anna F. Carroll files this, her Supplemental Brief, containing an itemization of her attorney's fees on appeal, including the basis for such fees.

I.

ITEMIZATION OF ATTORNEY'S FEES IN NO. 2005-CT-01770-COA

<u>DATE</u>	SERVICE	HOURS
09/04/05	Receipt of Appellant's Notice Of Appeal and conference with client	1.00
09/21/05	Preparation and filing of Cross-Appellant's Notice Of Appeal	.50
09/24/05	Preparation and filing of Appellee's Appearance form	.50
01/20/06	Review of Record and Transcript	2.00
04/27/06	Receipt and review of Appellant's Brief and Appellant's Record Excerpts and conference with client	2.00
06/06	Legal research in connection with preparation of Appelle/Cross-Appellant's Brief	12.00
07/06	Preparation of Appelle/Cross-Appellant's Brief and Record Excerpts	16.00
09/20/06	Receipt and review of Appellant's Emergency Motion To Stay and conference with client	1.00

10/06/06	Receipt and review of Appellant/Cross Appellee's Reply Brief and conference with client	1.00
05/03/07	Receipt and review of Court of Appeals' Decision and conference with client	1.50
05/30/07	Receipt and review of Appellant's Motion For Rehearing and conference with client	1.00
06/01/07	Preparation of Appellee/Cross-Appellant's Motion For Rehearing	3.00
06/13/07	Preparation and filing of Appellee's Response To Appellant's Motion For Rehearing	2.00
12/20/07	Receipt and review of Appellant's Petition For Writ Of Certiorari and conference with client	1.00
01/11/08	Preparation and filing of Appellee's Response To Appellant's Petition For Writ Of Certiorari	3.00
03/01/08	Receipt and review of Order Denying Appellant's Petition For Writ Of Certiorari and conference with client	1.00
	TOTAL	45.50

RECAPITULATION

Attorney's services - 45.50 hours x \$225.00 per hour = \$10,237.50

ITEMIZATION OF ATTORNEY'S FEES IN NO. 2010-CA-00823-COA

<u>DATE</u>	<u>SERVICE</u>	<u>HOURS</u>
05/19/10	Receipt and review of Notice of Appeal and conference with client	1.00
06/03/10	Receipt and review of Appellant's Designation Of Record	1.00
06/16/10	Preparation and filing of Appellee's Appearance form	1.00
07/17/10	Receipt and review of Appellant's Amended Designation Of Record	1.00
12/01/10	Receipt and review of Supreme Court Clerk's Deficiency Notice and conference with client	1.00
12/22/10	Receipt and review of Appellant's Extraordinary Motion To Permit Out-Of-Time Filing Of Brief and conference with client	1.00
01/23/11	Receipt and review of Appellant's Brief and Record Excerpts and conference with client	3.00
01/25/11	Preparation of Appellee's Motion For Time For Filing Brief	1.00
	The filing of this Motion was necessitated by the fact that the Appellant's Brief was not received by the undersigned attorney until January 23, 2011, over 30 days after it was filed with the Court.	
02/11	Legal research in connection with preparation of Appellee's Brief	12.00
03/11	Preparation of Appellee's Brief and Record Excerpts	14.00

05/09/11	Receipt and review of Appellant's Reply Brief and conference with client	1.00
11/01/11	Preparation of Supplemental Brief	2.00
	TOTAL	39.00

RECAPITULATION

Attorney's services - 39.00 hours x \$250.00 per hour = \$9,750.00

III.

Appellee's undersigned attorney was admitted to the Mississippi Bar in 1969 and has practiced law in Monroe County, Mississippi since January 1, 1971. A significant portion of his practice is devoted to domestic relations.

Respectfully submitted,

ATTORNEY FOR THE APPELLES

CARTER DOBBS, JR.
ATTORNEY FOR THE APPELLEE
MISSISSIPPI BAR NO.
POST OFFICE BOX 517
103 2ND AVENUE NORTH
AMORY, MISSISSIPPI 38821

TEL.: (662) 256-5697 FAX: (662) 256-1483

E-MAIL: carterdobbslaw@gmail.com

11.1261.mbw

CERTIFICATE OF SERVICE

I, Carter Dobbs, Jr., attorney for the Appellee, do hereby certify that I have, on this the

2nd day of November, 2011, mailed by United States mail, postage pre-paid, a true and
correct copy of the above and foregoing Supplemental Brief Of Appellee Anna F. Carroll to
Honorable Talmadge D. Littlejohn, Chancery Court Judge, at his usual mailing address of Post
Office Box 869, New Albany, Mississippi 38652-0869, to Honorable Ralph Stewart Guernsey,
attorney for the Appellant, at his usual mailing address of Law Firm of Thomas U. Reynolds,
Post Office Box 167, Water Valley, Mississippi 38965 and an original and 3 copies to Honorable
Kathy Gillis, Supreme Court Clerk of Mississippi, at her usual mailing address of Post Office
Box 249, Jackson, Mississippi 39205-0249.

CARTER DOBDS, JR.